
 
 
 

 

Bid Title Office Supplies 
Warehouse Stock 

 Number of Vendors 
Notified 

160 

Bid Number 09-007-SN  Number of Bids 
Distributed 

65 

Date 
Solicited 

February 06, 2008 
 

 Number of Vendors 
Bidding 

14 

Date Opened March 10, 2008  Number of Formal “No 
Bid” Responses 

4 

Date Board 
Presentation 

May 20, 2008 
 

 Funding Source 110 General 

Total Savings $64,070.78  Grand Total of Bid $110,704.20 

Recommendation: Recommend acceptance of bids as noted on the attached tabulation sheet as 
lowest and best bid meeting written specifications. 
Term of Contract: This is an annual purchase for office products to be stocked in the central 
warehouse for use throughout the District. 
Notations and Exceptions: Recommend acceptance of all lower bids as meeting the written 
specifications and testing criteria as specified in the bid documents with the following exceptions: 
 
OS-16: Recommend acceptance of bid from Ace Office Supplies as best bid meeting written 
specifications.  Lower bid from Standard Stationary Supply was evaluated and did not pass testing 
criteria; i.e., too thin and flimsy. 
 
OS-28: Recommend acceptance of bid from Bye-Mor, Inc. as best bid meeting written 
specifications.  Lower bid from Pyramid School Products and Business Stationers were evaluated 
and did not pass testing criteria; i.e., too thin and easily torn. 
 
OS-36: Recommend acceptance of bid from Smith Office & Computer Supply as best bid 
meeting written specifications.  Lower bids from Bye-More, Inc. and Pyramid School Products 
bid the same product.  Product did not pass testing criteria; i.e., easily ripped, closing device was 
weak and uneven and rings are loose. 
 
Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the above opening 
date and time.  All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby 
rejected as late. 
Bids Evaluated By:  District Employees: Joanne Auer, Michelle Bolin, Jennifer Brown, Sue 
Dunfee, Lorrie Sybert  
Bids Prepared By: 
Amy Flack, Buyer Assistant, Purchasing Department 
Reviewed and Authorized By: 
 Kendra Goodman, CPPB, Purchasing Agent 

Date/Time: May 14, 2008 11:39:00



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
OS-04 400 Paper Clips, Metal, Jumbo $3.75 $1,500.00 $3.00 $1,200.00

Pkgs. Sparco #85009 or equal

OS-05 240 Tape Dispencers 3" Core $2.49 $597.60 $16.31 $3,914.40
Each 3M #C-25 3M or equal

OS-06 2,400 Tape Dispensers 1" Core $1.03 $2,472.00 $0.77 $1,848.00 $1.81 $4,344.00
Each 3M #C-38 or equal

OS-07 3,000 File Folders, Hanging Letter Size $3.99 $11,970.00 $3.68 $11,040.00 $4.66 $13,980.00
Boxes Pendaflex ESS81602 1/5 Cut or equal

OS-11 3,600 Double Pocket Portfolios $5.89 $21,204.00 $4.56 $16,416.00
Boxes File EZ # 80128 or equal

OS-12 200 Rubber Bands, Large $1.79 $358.00
Boxes Alliance Eco # 117 or equal

OS-14 1,500 Rubber Bands, Assorted $0.59 $885.00 $0.61 $915.00
Bags Alliance Eco # 54 or equal

**BOARD MEETING 05/20/08**

Officemate / PCJ

Universal / 15001

631 Triumph Court, Unit #5
Orlando, FL 32805

Leonard / 301E

Leonard / 81300 As specified

3M / C38BK

Esselte / 1525

No Bid

No Bid

Charles Leonard / 56454

AFP Industries, Inc Apex Office Products, Inc

Tampa, FL 33603
5209 N. Howard Ave.

DATE OF OPENING: March 10, 2008 @ 2:30 p.m.

BID:  09-007-SN
P.O. Box 43-0747

South Miami, FL 33243-0747

Ace Office Supplies
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

Ampad / 421 1/5

ESSELTEBRK / 54828-00

Leonard / 56617

Leonard / 56454

No Bid

No bid

Status Plus / 61-040

As specified

Oxford / 54828-00

No bid

No bid
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION
OS-04 400 Paper Clips, Metal, Jumbo

Pkgs. Sparco #85009 or equal

OS-05 240 Tape Dispencers 3" Core
Each 3M #C-25 3M or equal

OS-06 2,400 Tape Dispensers 1" Core
Each 3M #C-38 or equal

OS-07 3,000 File Folders, Hanging Letter Size
Boxes Pendaflex ESS81602 1/5 Cut or equal

OS-11 3,600 Double Pocket Portfolios
Boxes File EZ # 80128 or equal

OS-12 200 Rubber Bands, Large
Boxes Alliance Eco # 117 or equal

OS-14 1,500 Rubber Bands, Assorted
Bags Alliance Eco # 54 or equal

**BOARD MEETING 05/20/08**

DATE OF OPENING: March 10, 2008 @ 2:30 p.m.

BID:  09-007-SN
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
$3.47 $1,388.00

$2.12 $508.80 $3.00 $720.00

$0.77 $1,848.00 $1.17 $2,808.00

$3.40 $10,200.00 $3.49 $10,470.00

$4.784 *$17,222.40

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Leonard / 900

Ampad / 421 1/5

As Specified

Bye-Mor, Inc.

Chico, CA 95973

Elgin School Supply Co., Inc.Business Stationers
3800 St. Patrick Street

Montreal, Quebec, Canada H4E IA4
260 Ryan Ave.PO Box 107

Kingsbury, IN 46345-0107

As specified

Leonard / 81300

No Bid

Oxford / 816002

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Status Plus / 61-042

Status Plus / 61-040

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION
OS-04 400 Paper Clips, Metal, Jumbo

Pkgs. Sparco #85009 or equal

OS-05 240 Tape Dispencers 3" Core
Each 3M #C-25 3M or equal

OS-06 2,400 Tape Dispensers 1" Core
Each 3M #C-38 or equal

OS-07 3,000 File Folders, Hanging Letter Size
Boxes Pendaflex ESS81602 1/5 Cut or equal

OS-11 3,600 Double Pocket Portfolios
Boxes File EZ # 80128 or equal

OS-12 200 Rubber Bands, Large
Boxes Alliance Eco # 117 or equal

OS-14 1,500 Rubber Bands, Assorted
Bags Alliance Eco # 54 or equal

**BOARD MEETING 05/20/08**

DATE OF OPENING: March 10, 2008 @ 2:30 p.m.

BID:  09-007-SN
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
$5.10 $2,040.00

$19.31 $4,634.40

$1.49 $3,576.00

$9.55 $28,650.00

$5.22 $18,792.00 $17.99 $64,764.00

$4.50 $900.00

$4.10 $6,150.00

2195 Elizabeth Ave
National Art & School Supplies

Rahway, NJ 07065

GBC Nitron Global Services Corp.
1 GBC Plaza 5016 Londonberry Drive, Ste #1

Tampa, FL 33647Northbrook, IL 60062

No Bid

No Bid

As specified

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

As specified

No Bid

No Bid

As specified

As specified

As specified

Oxford

As specified

Alliance / ALL24545
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION
OS-04 400 Paper Clips, Metal, Jumbo

Pkgs. Sparco #85009 or equal

OS-05 240 Tape Dispencers 3" Core
Each 3M #C-25 3M or equal

OS-06 2,400 Tape Dispensers 1" Core
Each 3M #C-38 or equal

OS-07 3,000 File Folders, Hanging Letter Size
Boxes Pendaflex ESS81602 1/5 Cut or equal

OS-11 3,600 Double Pocket Portfolios
Boxes File EZ # 80128 or equal

OS-12 200 Rubber Bands, Large
Boxes Alliance Eco # 117 or equal

OS-14 1,500 Rubber Bands, Assorted
Bags Alliance Eco # 54 or equal

**BOARD MEETING 05/20/08**

DATE OF OPENING: March 10, 2008 @ 2:30 p.m.

BID:  09-007-SN
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
$3.40 $1,360.00 $2.99 $1,196.00

$2.09 $501.60 $6.89 $1,653.60

$0.74 $1,776.00 $1.60 $3,840.00

$3.37 $10,110.00 $3.89 $11,670.00 $3.55 $10,650.00

$4.77 $17,172.00 $6.93 $24,948.00

$1.75 $350.00 $1.79 $358.00

$0.49 $735.00 $0.465 $697.50

3M / BID-HB900

Smith Office & Computer SupplyQuill CorporationPyramid School Products
1009 S. 21st Avenue

Hollywood, FL 33020Lincolnshire, IL 60069
100 Schelter Road6510 North 54th Street

Tampa, FL 3

Quill / BID-PIJGC. Leonard / 301F (1144740)

Status Plus / 61-042 (1099308)

Status Plus / 61-040 (1111582)

As specified

As specified

As specified

As specified

No Bid

No Bid

As specified

Quill / BID-7128AD

Quill / BID-790117

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Esselte/Oxford / 372 1/5

3M / BID-C60BK

Quill / BID-7Q5215
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION
OS-04 400 Paper Clips, Metal, Jumbo

Pkgs. Sparco #85009 or equal

OS-05 240 Tape Dispencers 3" Core
Each 3M #C-25 3M or equal

OS-06 2,400 Tape Dispensers 1" Core
Each 3M #C-38 or equal

OS-07 3,000 File Folders, Hanging Letter Size
Boxes Pendaflex ESS81602 1/5 Cut or equal

OS-11 3,600 Double Pocket Portfolios
Boxes File EZ # 80128 or equal

OS-12 200 Rubber Bands, Large
Boxes Alliance Eco # 117 or equal

OS-14 1,500 Rubber Bands, Assorted
Bags Alliance Eco # 54 or equal

**BOARD MEETING 05/20/08**

DATE OF OPENING: March 10, 2008 @ 2:30 p.m.

BID:  09-007-SN
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
$2.75 $1,100.00 $3.16 $1,264.00

$14.21 $3,410.00 $2.80 $672.00

$1.84 $441.60

$0.747 $1,792.80 $1.88 $4,512.00

$3.54 $10,620.00 $4.60 $13,800.00

$4.32 $15,552.00 $8.68 $31,248.00

$1.99 $398.00

$0.348 $522.00 $0.75 $1,125.00

OIC / 99914

Charles Leonard / 81300

MMM / C38BK

Ampad / 421 1/5

Ampad / 36110-00

Alliance / 28174

Alliance / 28548

Oxford / 54828

No Bid

Generae / 54

OIC / PC.G-99914

As Specified

Standards / C38

Ampad / 421 1/5

Alternate Standards / G250

Total Office Products
9452 Philips Hwy., Ste. 7
Jacksonville, FL 32256

Standard Stationary Supply 

Wheeling, IL 60090
2251 S. Foster Ave.
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
**BOARD MEETING 05/20/08**

631 Triumph Court, Unit #5
Orlando, FL 32805

AFP Industries, Inc Apex Office Products, Inc

Tampa, FL 33603
5209 N. Howard Ave.

DATE OF OPENING: March 10, 2008 @ 2:30 p.m.

BID:  09-007-SN
P.O. Box 43-0747

South Miami, FL 33243-0747

Ace Office Supplies
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

OS-15 5,000 Scissors $1.89 $9,450.00 $0.51 $2,550.00 $1.61 $8,050.00
Each Clauss Cutlery or equal

OS-16 4,000 Sheet Protectors $1.65 $6,600.00 $2.39 $9,560.00 $3.39 $13,560.00
Boxes Sparco # 74102 or equal

OS-19 1,000 Tape, Magic Transparent 1' Core $4.48 $4,480.00 $4.46 $4,460.00 $6.96 $6,960.00
Boxes 3M Brand MMM810121296 or equal

OS-26 240 Post-It-Notes 3" x 3" Size Pink
Pkgs. 3M # 654-PK or equal

OS-27 480 Post-It-Notes 3" x 3" Size Blue
Pkgs. 3M # 654-BE or equal

OS-28 1,200 Staple Removers $0.25 $300.00 $0.16 $192.00 $0.26 $312.00
Each Bostitch #G600 or equal

Fiskars / 21087797

C-Line / 90129

3M / 6200 1/2 x 1296

No Bid

TOTAL FOR ITEMS OS026 THROUGH OS027 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Status Plus / 34-151

Mend-All / 60-662

No Bid No Bid

Officemate / 95691Status Plus / 66-008

No Bid

No Bid

Leonard / 050

ACME / 40618

Universal / 21124

Leonard / 49512

Status Plus / 26-183

No Bid
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION
**BOARD MEETING 05/20/08**

DATE OF OPENING: March 10, 2008 @ 2:30 p.m.

BID:  09-007-SN
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

OS-15 5,000 Scissors
Each Clauss Cutlery or equal

OS-16 4,000 Sheet Protectors
Boxes Sparco # 74102 or equal

OS-19 1,000 Tape, Magic Transparent 1' Core
Boxes 3M Brand MMM810121296 or equal

OS-26 240 Post-It-Notes 3" x 3" Size Pink
Pkgs. 3M # 654-PK or equal

OS-27 480 Post-It-Notes 3" x 3" Size Blue
Pkgs. 3M # 654-BE or equal

OS-28 1,200 Staple Removers
Each Bostitch #G600 or equal

TOTAL FOR ITEMS OS026 THROUGH OS027

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Bye-Mor, Inc.

Chico, CA 95973

Elgin School Supply Co., Inc.Business Stationers
3800 St. Patrick Street

Montreal, Quebec, Canada H4E IA4
260 Ryan Ave.PO Box 107

Kingsbury, IN 46345-0107

$2.20 $11,000.00 $0.58 *$2,900.00 $4.76 $23,800.00

$1.86 $9,300.00

$1.58 $6,320.00 $3.38 $13,520.00 $4.39 $17,560.00

$1.76 $7,040.00

$4.20 $4,200.00 $14.39 $14,390.00

$2.26 $542.40 $8.15 $1,956.00

$2.26 $1,084.80 $8.15 $3,912.00

$0.155 $186.00 $0.28 $336.00 $0.31 $372.00

Armada / SN666A

As specified

No Bid*$5,868.00

Acme / 43085

As specified

3M / 654 / Yellow only

3M / 654 / Yellow only

Sparco / 86000

Samsill / 42296

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

As specified

Gurst-Metall / 26-243

Gurst-Metall / 26-102

Status Plus / 34-150

Status Plus / 34-151

Mend-All / 60-662

Stickety-Do / 60-449

Stickety-Do / 60-447

$1,627.20

Status Plus / 66-008

Page 7 of 15



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION
**BOARD MEETING 05/20/08**

DATE OF OPENING: March 10, 2008 @ 2:30 p.m.

BID:  09-007-SN
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

OS-15 5,000 Scissors
Each Clauss Cutlery or equal

OS-16 4,000 Sheet Protectors
Boxes Sparco # 74102 or equal

OS-19 1,000 Tape, Magic Transparent 1' Core
Boxes 3M Brand MMM810121296 or equal

OS-26 240 Post-It-Notes 3" x 3" Size Pink
Pkgs. 3M # 654-PK or equal

OS-27 480 Post-It-Notes 3" x 3" Size Blue
Pkgs. 3M # 654-BE or equal

OS-28 1,200 Staple Removers
Each Bostitch #G600 or equal

TOTAL FOR ITEMS OS026 THROUGH OS027

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

2195 Elizabeth Ave
National Art & School Supplies

Rahway, NJ 07065

GBC Nitron Global Services Corp.
1 GBC Plaza 5016 Londonberry Drive, Ste #1

Tampa, FL 33647Northbrook, IL 60062

$1.89 $9,450.00

$6.89 $27,460.00

$11.97 $11,970.00 $1.79 $1,790.00

$9.97 $2,392.80

$9.50 $4,560.00

$0.50 $600.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

As specified

As specified

As specified

$6,592.80

Universal / UNV00700

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

As specified

No Bid

Universal / UNV9200

As specified
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION
**BOARD MEETING 05/20/08**

DATE OF OPENING: March 10, 2008 @ 2:30 p.m.

BID:  09-007-SN
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

OS-15 5,000 Scissors
Each Clauss Cutlery or equal

OS-16 4,000 Sheet Protectors
Boxes Sparco # 74102 or equal

OS-19 1,000 Tape, Magic Transparent 1' Core
Boxes 3M Brand MMM810121296 or equal

OS-26 240 Post-It-Notes 3" x 3" Size Pink
Pkgs. 3M # 654-PK or equal

OS-27 480 Post-It-Notes 3" x 3" Size Blue
Pkgs. 3M # 654-BE or equal

OS-28 1,200 Staple Removers
Each Bostitch #G600 or equal

TOTAL FOR ITEMS OS026 THROUGH OS027

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Smith Office & Computer SupplyQuill CorporationPyramid School Products
1009 S. 21st Avenue

Hollywood, FL 33020Lincolnshire, IL 60069
100 Schelter Road6510 North 54th Street

Tampa, FL 3

$2.18 $10,900.00 $0.79 $3,950.00

$1.89 $7,560.00 $6.87 $27,480.00

$4.20 $4,200.00 $6.36 $6,360.00 $5.09 $5,090.00

$0.15 $180.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Leonard / 48185(1102144)

No Bid

No Bid

Status Plus / 66-008 (1111384)

Mend-All / 60-662 (1111640)

Acme / Wescott19018(1040674) Quill / BID-790701BE

Avery / BID-74102

Quill / BID-765001

No Bid

No Bid

3M / 6200 1/2 x 1296

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION
**BOARD MEETING 05/20/08**

DATE OF OPENING: March 10, 2008 @ 2:30 p.m.

BID:  09-007-SN
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

OS-15 5,000 Scissors
Each Clauss Cutlery or equal

OS-16 4,000 Sheet Protectors
Boxes Sparco # 74102 or equal

OS-19 1,000 Tape, Magic Transparent 1' Core
Boxes 3M Brand MMM810121296 or equal

OS-26 240 Post-It-Notes 3" x 3" Size Pink
Pkgs. 3M # 654-PK or equal

OS-27 480 Post-It-Notes 3" x 3" Size Blue
Pkgs. 3M # 654-BE or equal

OS-28 1,200 Staple Removers
Each Bostitch #G600 or equal

TOTAL FOR ITEMS OS026 THROUGH OS027

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Total Office Products
9452 Philips Hwy., Ste. 7
Jacksonville, FL 32256

Standard Stationary Supply 

Wheeling, IL 60090
2251 S. Foster Ave.

$0.428 $2,140.00 $5.97 $29,850.00

$1.38 $5,520.00 $2.74 $10,960.00

$12.43 $12,430.00 $5.38 $5,380.00

$2.08 $499.20

$2.08 $998.40

$0.50 $600.00

As specified

Beautone / 11031

Beautone / 11032

No Bid$1,497.60

Premier / 42294

Standards / 2100 Clauss / 18080

C-Line / 62037

Charles Leonard / 49512

No Bid

No Bid

Charles Leonard / 050
No Bid
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
**BOARD MEETING 05/20/08**

631 Triumph Court, Unit #5
Orlando, FL 32805

AFP Industries, Inc Apex Office Products, Inc

Tampa, FL 33603
5209 N. Howard Ave.

DATE OF OPENING: March 10, 2008 @ 2:30 p.m.

BID:  09-007-SN
P.O. Box 43-0747

South Miami, FL 33243-0747

Ace Office Supplies
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

OS-30 800 Vinyl-Coated Paper Clips # 1 Size $3.95 $3,160.00 $3.98 $3,184.00 $4.70 $3,760.00
Ctns. Sparco Brand 01603 or equal

OS-31 800 Vinyl-Coated Paper Clips Jumbo Size $8.95 $7,160.00 $7.66 $6,128.00 $11.70 $9,360.00
Ctns. Sparco # 01604 or equal

OS-34 27,000 3-Ring Present Binders 1" Capacity, White $0.83 $22,410.00 $0.93 $25,110.00 $1.09 $29,430.00
Each Wilson Jones # W362-14W or equal

OS-35 12,000 3-Ring Present Binders 2" Capacity, White $1.46 $17,520.00 $1.64 $19,680.00 $2.09 $25,080.00
Each Wilson Jones # W362-44W or equal

OS-36 2,880 3-Ring Present Binder 3" Capacity, White $2.29 $6,595.20 $2.56 $7,372.80 $3.07 $8,841.60
Each Wilson Jones # W362-49W or equal

OS-44 2,400 Transparency Film Copier/Laser $6.88 $16,512.00
Boxes Zewar # CRS100 or equal

Avery / CV11-10-WE

Avery / CV11-20-WE

Avery CV11-25-WE

No Bid

As specified

As specified

As specified

No Bid

As specified

As specified

Status Plus / 50-024Leonard / 80033BRN

Leonard / 80050BRN

As specified 

Status Plus / 50-039

Samsill / 18537C

Samsill / 18567C

Samsill / 18587C

* Indicates total price calculated by the District.
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION
**BOARD MEETING 05/20/08**

DATE OF OPENING: March 10, 2008 @ 2:30 p.m.

BID:  09-007-SN
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

OS-30 800 Vinyl-Coated Paper Clips # 1 Size
Ctns. Sparco Brand 01603 or equal

OS-31 800 Vinyl-Coated Paper Clips Jumbo Size
Ctns. Sparco # 01604 or equal

OS-34 27,000 3-Ring Present Binders 1" Capacity, White
Each Wilson Jones # W362-14W or equal

OS-35 12,000 3-Ring Present Binders 2" Capacity, White
Each Wilson Jones # W362-44W or equal

OS-36 2,880 3-Ring Present Binder 3" Capacity, White
Each Wilson Jones # W362-49W or equal

OS-44 2,400 Transparency Film Copier/Laser
Boxes Zewar # CRS100 or equal

* Indicates total price calculated by the District.

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Bye-Mor, Inc.

Chico, CA 95973

Elgin School Supply Co., Inc.Business Stationers
3800 St. Patrick Street

Montreal, Quebec, Canada H4E IA4
260 Ryan Ave.PO Box 107

Kingsbury, IN 46345-0107

$3.80 $3,040.00 $2.10 $1,680.00 $3.99 $3,192.00

$7.26 $5,808.00 $12.08 $9,664.00

$0.93 $25,110.00 $0.93 $25,110.00

$1.42 $17,040.00 $1.64 $19,680.00

$2.23 $6,422.40 $2.555 $7,358.40

$5.58 $13,392.00 $6.44 *$15,456.00

Samsill / 18567C

Samsill / 18587C

Prec 1M / 10-110

No Bid

Status Plus / 101-127

As specified

As specified

Samsill / 18537C

Leonard / 80033

No Bid

Samsill / 18537C

Samsill / 18567C

No Bid

Samsill / 18587C

Status Plus / 50-024

Status Plus / 50-039

No Bid

No Bid
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION
**BOARD MEETING 05/20/08**

DATE OF OPENING: March 10, 2008 @ 2:30 p.m.

BID:  09-007-SN
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

OS-30 800 Vinyl-Coated Paper Clips # 1 Size
Ctns. Sparco Brand 01603 or equal

OS-31 800 Vinyl-Coated Paper Clips Jumbo Size
Ctns. Sparco # 01604 or equal

OS-34 27,000 3-Ring Present Binders 1" Capacity, White
Each Wilson Jones # W362-14W or equal

OS-35 12,000 3-Ring Present Binders 2" Capacity, White
Each Wilson Jones # W362-44W or equal

OS-36 2,880 3-Ring Present Binder 3" Capacity, White
Each Wilson Jones # W362-49W or equal

OS-44 2,400 Transparency Film Copier/Laser
Boxes Zewar # CRS100 or equal

* Indicates total price calculated by the District.

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

2195 Elizabeth Ave
National Art & School Supplies

Rahway, NJ 07065

GBC Nitron Global Services Corp.
1 GBC Plaza 5016 Londonberry Drive, Ste #1

Tampa, FL 33647Northbrook, IL 60062

$8.40 $6,720.00

$13.00 $10,400.00

$1.14 $30,780.00 $1.91 $51,570.00

$1.79 $21,480.00 $2.85 $34,300.00

$2.59 $745.92 $5.05 $14,544.00

$23.48 $56,352.00

No Bid

No Bid

As specified

As specified

As specified

As specified

No Bid

GBC / 8313001

GBC / 8313003
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

GBC / 8313051

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
As specified

3M / MMMPP2200
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION
**BOARD MEETING 05/20/08**

DATE OF OPENING: March 10, 2008 @ 2:30 p.m.

BID:  09-007-SN
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

OS-30 800 Vinyl-Coated Paper Clips # 1 Size
Ctns. Sparco Brand 01603 or equal

OS-31 800 Vinyl-Coated Paper Clips Jumbo Size
Ctns. Sparco # 01604 or equal

OS-34 27,000 3-Ring Present Binders 1" Capacity, White
Each Wilson Jones # W362-14W or equal

OS-35 12,000 3-Ring Present Binders 2" Capacity, White
Each Wilson Jones # W362-44W or equal

OS-36 2,880 3-Ring Present Binder 3" Capacity, White
Each Wilson Jones # W362-49W or equal

OS-44 2,400 Transparency Film Copier/Laser
Boxes Zewar # CRS100 or equal

* Indicates total price calculated by the District.

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Smith Office & Computer SupplyQuill CorporationPyramid School Products
1009 S. 21st Avenue

Hollywood, FL 33020Lincolnshire, IL 60069
100 Schelter Road6510 North 54th Street

Tampa, FL 3

$4.80 $3,840.00

$13.90 $11,120.00

$0.90 $24,300.00 $1.72 $46,440.00 $0.90 $24,300.00

$1.43 $17,160.00 $2.71 $32,520.00 $1.70 $20,400.00

$2.25 $6,480.00 $3.48 $10,022.40 $2.48 $7,142.40

$6.35 $15,240.00

Quill / BID-7221WE

Quill / BID-7222WE

Quill / BID-7223WE

Leonard / 80033 (1205871)

Leonard / 85050 (1207752)

Samsill / 18537C

Samsill / 18567C As specified

As specified

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

As specified

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Samsill / 18587C

Precision / 10-110 (1206606)
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION
**BOARD MEETING 05/20/08**

DATE OF OPENING: March 10, 2008 @ 2:30 p.m.

BID:  09-007-SN
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

OS-30 800 Vinyl-Coated Paper Clips # 1 Size
Ctns. Sparco Brand 01603 or equal

OS-31 800 Vinyl-Coated Paper Clips Jumbo Size
Ctns. Sparco # 01604 or equal

OS-34 27,000 3-Ring Present Binders 1" Capacity, White
Each Wilson Jones # W362-14W or equal

OS-35 12,000 3-Ring Present Binders 2" Capacity, White
Each Wilson Jones # W362-44W or equal

OS-36 2,880 3-Ring Present Binder 3" Capacity, White
Each Wilson Jones # W362-49W or equal

OS-44 2,400 Transparency Film Copier/Laser
Boxes Zewar # CRS100 or equal

* Indicates total price calculated by the District.

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Total Office Products
9452 Philips Hwy., Ste. 7
Jacksonville, FL 32256

Standard Stationary Supply 

Wheeling, IL 60090
2251 S. Foster Ave.

$2.76 $2,208.00

$6.99 $5,592.00

$1.02 $27,540.00 $1.06 $28,620.00

$0.925 $24,975.00

$1.78 $21,360.00 $1.90 $22,800.00

$1.63 $19,560.00

$2.73 $7,862.40 $2.92 $8,409.60

$2.55 $7,344.00

$6.65 $15,960.00 $7.47 $17,928.00
MMM / 903

Charles Leonard / 93350

Charles Leonard / 93333

Wilson Jones / 27606

Zelar / CRS-100

Alternate Samsill / 18537C

Alternate Samsill / 18537C

Alternate Samsill / 18587C

Samsil / 18537C

Samsil / 18587C

Samsil / 18567C

No Bid

No Bid

Wilson Jones / 27602

Wilson Jones / 27604
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