
Date/Time: April 27, 2005 09:11:00 

 
 
 

Bid Title Classroom Supplies-
Warehouse Stock/Part I 

 Number of Vendors 
Notified 

172 

Bid Number 06-008-GF  Number of Bids 
Distributed 

50 

Date 
Solicited 

3/10/2005  Number of Vendors 
Responding 

25 

Date Opened 3/31/2005  Number of Vendors Not 
Bidding 

8 

Date Board 
Presentation 

5/3/2005  Number of Vendors 
Bidding 

17 

Total Savings $8,672.42  Grand Total of Bid $91,714.60 
Part I 

Recommendation:  Recommend acceptance of bids as noted on the attached tabulation sheet as 
lowest and best bid meeting written specifications and testing criteria. 
Term of Contract:  This is a one time purchase for classroom supplies to be stocked in the 
Central Warehouse to be utilized by various Departments and Schools. 
Notations and Exceptions:   Bid from National Art could not be considered as vendor failed to 
properly execute bid documents (i.e. bid documents was not returned in its’ entirety).  GBC could 
not be considered as product bid was not required. 
 
Item CS-05:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Elgin – all lower priced bids either did not 
provide samples for evaluation purposes as specified; or if samples were provided, they did not 
meet testing criteria (i.e., poor quality, durability). 
 
Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the above opening 
date and time.  All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby 
rejected as late. 
Bids Evaluated By: 
Betsy Eanes, Secretary, Employee Benefits 
Jan Hawkins, Secretary, Food & Nutrition 
Joanne Hattaway, Secretary, Community Career Technical Center 
Amber Robinson, Secretary, Curriculum and Instructional Services 
Liz Supeau, Bookkeeper, Curriculum and Instructional Service   
Bids Prepared By: 
Gail Fowler, CPPB, Buyer 
Reviewed and Authorized By: 
Kendra Goodman, CPPB, Purchasing Agent 
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06-008-GF  

Recommendation 
 

Item CS-07:  Still being evaluated – Will forward to a later Board Meeting. 
 
Item CS-08:  Still being evaluated – Will forward to a later Board Meeting. 
 
Item CS-09:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Standard Stationery as lowest and best bid meeting 
written specifications – all lower priced bids either did not provide samples for evaluation purposes as 
specified; or if samples were provided, they did not meet testing criteria (i.e., drying time excessive, too 
hard to squeeze container because the glue was to thick to flow properly). 
 
Item CS-09A:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Standard Stationery as lowest and best bid meeting 
written specifications – all lower priced bids either did not provide samples for evaluation purposes as 
specified; or if samples were provided, they did not meet testing criteria (i.e., drying time excessive, too 
hard to squeeze container due glue was to thick to flow properly). 
 
Item CS-11:  REJECT – No samples meeting written specifications were received.  Request permission to 
purchase on the open market. 
 
Item CS-13:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Elgin as best bid meeting written specifications – all 
lower priced bids either did not provide samples for evaluation purposes as specified; or if samples were 
provided, they did not meet testing criteria (i.e., poor quality, durability, dry, color density, smoothness). 
 
Item CS-14:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Elgin as lowest and best bid meeting written 
specifications – all lower priced bids either did not provide samples for evaluation purposes as specified; or 
if samples were provided, they did not meet testing criteria (i.e., poor quality, durability, dry, color density, 
smoothness). 
 
Item CS-15:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Windtree Enterprises as lowest and best bid meeting 
written specifications – all lower priced bids either did not provide samples for evaluation purposes as 
specified; or if samples were provided, they did not meet testing criteria (i.e., poor quality, durability, dry, 
color density, smoothness). 
 
Item CS-16:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Windtree Enterprises as lowest and best bid meeting 
written specifications – all lower priced bids either did not provide samples for evaluation purposes as 
specified; or if samples were provided, they did not meet testing criteria (i.e., poor quality, durability, dry, 
color density, smoothness). 
 
Item CS-17:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Classic School Supply as lowest and best bid meeting 
written specifications – all lower priced bids either did not provide samples for evaluation purposes as 
specified; or if samples were provided, they did not meet testing criteria (i.e., sharpens hard and rough). 
 
Item CS-18:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Classic School Supply as lowest and best bid meeting 
written specifications – all lower priced bids either did not provide samples for evaluation purposes as 
specified; or if samples were provided, they did not meet testing criteria (i.e., poor quality, poor color 
intensity, durability of lead). 
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Recommendation 

 

Item CS-22B:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Standard Stationery as lowest and best bid meeting 
written specifications – lower priced bid from Standard Stationery did not provide samples for evaluation 
purposes as specified; or if samples were provided, they did not meet testing criteria (i.e., poor cutting 
quality, poor grip, and hard to open). 
 
Item CS-22S:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Standard Stationery as lowest and best bid meeting 
written specifications – all lower priced bids either did not provide samples for evaluation purposes as 
specified; or if samples were provided, they did not meet testing criteria (i.e., poor cutting quality, poor 
grip, and hard to open). 
 
Item CS-25:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Pyramid School Products as lowest and best bid meeting 
written specifications – all lower priced bids either did not provide samples for evaluation purposes as 
specified; or if samples were provided, they did not meet testing criteria (i.e., too thin, poor adhesive). 
 
Item CS-45:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Pyramid School Products as lowest and best bid meeting 
written specifications – all lower priced bids did not provide samples for evaluation purposes as specified; 
or if samples were provided, they did not meet testing criteria (i.e., flimsy, poor durability). 
 
Item CS-46:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Pyramid School Products as lowest and best bid meeting 
written specifications – all lower priced bids did not provide samples for evaluation purposes as specified; 
or if samples were provided, they did not meet testing criteria (i.e., flimsy, poor durability). 
 
Item CS-48:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Windtree Enterprise as lowest and best bid meeting 
written specifications – all lower priced bids either did not provide samples for evaluation purposes as 
specified; or if samples were provided, they did not meet testing criteria (i.e., poor quality, durability, 
smoothness, color intensity). 
 
Item CS-49:  Recommend acceptance of bid from School Specialty as lowest and best bid meeting written 
specifications – all lower priced bids either did not provide samples for evaluation purposes as specified; or 
if samples were provided, they did not meet testing criteria (i.e., poor quality, durability, smoothness, color 
intensity). 
 
Item CS-50:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Elgin as lowest and best bid meeting written 
specifications – all lower priced bids either did not provide samples for evaluation purposes as specified; or 
if samples were provided, they did not meet testing criteria (i.e., poor quality, durability, smoothness, color 
intensity). 
 
Item CS-51:  Recommend acceptance of bid from Bye-Mo’r, Inc. as lowest and best bid meeting written 
specifications – all lower priced bids either did not provide samples for evaluation purposes as specified; or 
if samples were provided, they did not meet testing criteria (i.e., poor quality, durability, smoothness, color 
intensity). 
 
 



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  MARCH 31, 2005 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
BID #06-008-GF

Item # Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
CS-05 PINK PEARL ERASER  (2 dozen per box)  (600) $2.28 $1,368.00 No Bid $2.04 $1,224.00

Manufacturer and Model #

CS-05 PINK PEARL ERASER  (2 dozen per box)  (600) - ALT No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-07 FLAG, STATE  OUTDOOR (50) No Bid $32.95 $1,647.50 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-08 FLAG, US OUTDOOR  (100) $18.28 $1,828.00 $17.25 $1,725.00 No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-08 FLAG, US OUTDOOR  (100) - ALTERNATE No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-09 GLUE 4 oz.  (12/box)   (1,200) $3.82 $4,584.00 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-09A GLUE  GALLON   (180) No Bid No Bid $9.77 $1,758.60
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-11   PASTE QUART     (120) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-12 PENCILS  ELEM.  W/ERASER  (12/box) (1,200)   No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-12 PENCILS  ELEM.  W/ERASER  (12/box) (1,200) - ALT  No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

AFP Industries, Inc.
P.O. Box 43-0747

South Miami, FL 33243
305-663-8300

Status Plus 13-061

Valley Forge 35111000

Elmers E304NR

631-361-6003

Valley Forge 35232095

Valley Forge 35111000

Apex Office Products, Inc.
5209 N. Howard Ave.

Tampa, FL 33603
813-871-2010

Leonard 71504

All Flag & Flagpoles, Inc.
73 Route 111

Smithtown, NY 11787

Elmers E395



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  MARCH 31, 2005 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
BID #06-008-GF

Item # Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

AFP Industries, Inc.
P.O. Box 43-0747

South Miami, FL 33243
305-663-8300 631-361-6003

Apex Office Products, Inc.
5209 N. Howard Ave.

Tampa, FL 33603
813-871-2010

All Flag & Flagpoles, Inc.
73 Route 111

Smithtown, NY 11787

CS-13 PEN OVERHEAD  BLACK  REMOV. 12/PKG.   (1,200) $1.94 $2,328.00 No Bid $2.11 $2,532.00
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-14 PEN, OVERHEAD ASSORTED 4/PKG.  (2,400) $0.89 $2,136.00 No Bid $0.96 $2,304.00
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-15 PEN, OVERHEAD/BLK/PERM. 12/PKG.  (600) $2.08 $1,248.00 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-16 PEN, OVERHEAD/ASST./PERM 4/PKG.  (600) $1.18 $708.00 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-17 PENCIL SHARPENER METAL  EACH  (1,200) $5.88 $7,056.00 No Bid $6.96 $8,352.00
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-17 PENCIL SHARPENER METAL  EACH  (1,200) - ALT No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-18 CLEANER, MARKERBOARD 8 oz. EACH  (3,000) $1.18 $3,540.00 No Bid $1.48 $4,440.00
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-21 RULERS, PLASTIC, 12"  Box   (1,800) $1.18 $2,124.00 No Bid $5.76 *$3456.00
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-22B SCISSORS 4-1/2" BLUNT 12/BOX  (1,200) $2.46 $2,952.00 No Bid $5.04 $6,048.00
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-22B SCISSORS 4-1/2" BLUNT 12/BOX  (1,200) - ALT No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

Liqui Mark 17400

Status Plus 10004

Liqui Mark 12121

Correct Solutions 50000

Status Plus 23061

SchoolMate 721

Liqui Mark 12004

Liqui Mark 17121

Liqui Mark 12121

Liqui Mark 12004

Leonard 89508

Sanford 81803

Leonard 77510

*Leonard 77412 (1.92/dzn)



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  MARCH 31, 2005 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
BID #06-008-GF

Item # Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

AFP Industries, Inc.
P.O. Box 43-0747

South Miami, FL 33243
305-663-8300 631-361-6003

Apex Office Products, Inc.
5209 N. Howard Ave.

Tampa, FL 33603
813-871-2010

All Flag & Flagpoles, Inc.
73 Route 111

Smithtown, NY 11787

CS-22S SCISSORS 401/2" SHARP 12/BOX  (1,200) $2.56 $3,072.00 No Bid $5.04 $6,048.00
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-22S SCISSORS 401/2" SHARP 12/BOX  (1,200) - ALT No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-25 TAPE MASKING 3/4" 12/ PKG>  (240) $4.88 $1,171.20 No Bid $7.92 $1,900.80
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-25 TAPE MASKING 3/4" 12/ PKG>  (240) - ALT No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-35 SHOWBOARDS, FOLDING 3'x4' EACH  (1,800) $1.58 $2,844.00 No Bid $2.62 $4,716.00
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-45 FASTENERS, RND/BRASS 3/8" 1,000/ CTN  (240) No Bid No Bid $3.68 $883.20
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-46 FASTENERS, RND/BRASS 1" 1,000/ CTN  (120) No Bid No Bid $5.94 $712.80
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-48 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 4/SET  (3,000) $1.43 $4,290.00 No Bid $1.64 $4,920.00
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-49 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 8/SET  (3,000) $2.78 $8,340.00 No Bid $3.17 $9,510.00
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-50 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 4/SET  (2,400) $1.43 $3,432.00 No Bid $1.64 $3,936.00
Manufacturer and Model #

LePage 40201

Flipside 30032

Liqui Mark 25400

Liqui Mark 25800

Liqui Mark 24400

SchoolMate 722 Leonard 77505

3-M 260034x60

Showboard SB24K

Leonard 67001

Leonard 67004

Liqui Mark 25400

Liqui Mark 25800

Liqui Mark 24400



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  MARCH 31, 2005 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
BID #06-008-GF

Item # Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

AFP Industries, Inc.
P.O. Box 43-0747

South Miami, FL 33243
305-663-8300 631-361-6003

Apex Office Products, Inc.
5209 N. Howard Ave.

Tampa, FL 33603
813-871-2010

All Flag & Flagpoles, Inc.
73 Route 111

Smithtown, NY 11787

CS-51 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 8/SET  (2,400) $2.78 $6,672.00 No Bid $3.17 $7,608.00
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-51 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 8/SET  (2,400)-ALT No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

No Bid
CS-53 PENCILS, MECHANICAL  .5MM EACH  (1,200) No Bid $1.99 $2,388.00

Manufacturer and Model #

CS-55 PENCILS #2 (144/PKG.)  (2,400) $5.02 $12,048.00 No Bid $7.32 $17,568.00
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-56 PENCILS ELEC. TEST SCORING 12/BOX  (200) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-57 ERASERS, MARKER BOARD MULTI PACK 12/BOX ( $10.28 $3,084.00 No Bid $16.68 $5,004.00
Manufacturer and Model # Status Plus 06-056

Liqui Mark 24800

Sanford 22420

*Packed 36/box

Liqui Mark 24800

Sanford/Papermate 64051

Sanford 12132

Sanford 81505



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  MARCH 31, 2005 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
BID #06-008-GF

Item # Description
CS-05 PINK PEARL ERASER  (2 dozen per box)  (600)

Manufacturer and Model #

CS-05 PINK PEARL ERASER  (2 dozen per box)  (600) - ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-07 FLAG, STATE  OUTDOOR (50)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-08 FLAG, US OUTDOOR  (100)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-08 FLAG, US OUTDOOR  (100) - ALTERNATE
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-09 GLUE 4 oz.  (12/box)   (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-09A GLUE  GALLON   (180)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-11   PASTE QUART     (120)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-12 PENCILS  ELEM.  W/ERASER  (12/box) (1,200)   
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-12 PENCILS  ELEM.  W/ERASER  (12/box) (1,200) - ALT  
Manufacturer and Model #

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
$1.99 $1,194.00 $1.85 $1,110.00 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid $19.00 $950.00

No Bid No Bid $16.65 $1,665.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$3.877 $4,652.40 No Bid No Bid

$5.85 $1,053.00 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$1.65 $1,980.00 $1.42 $1,704.00 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

P.O. Box 107
Kingsbury, IN 46345

800-847-9219

Dixon 3308

Bye-Mo'r, Inc.

Leonard 71504

Elmers E304

Elmers E395

Waynesboro, VA 22980
P.O. Box 178

888-885-2488

Classic School Supply, Inc.

Gustav 13061

Dixon 13304

Con Serv Flag Company
P.O. Box 649

Sidney, NE 69162
308-254-4720

Valley Forge 35232090

Valley Forge 35211000



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  MARCH 31, 2005 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
BID #06-008-GF

Item # Description
CS-13 PEN OVERHEAD  BLACK  REMOV. 12/PKG.   (1,200)

Manufacturer and Model #

CS-14 PEN, OVERHEAD ASSORTED 4/PKG.  (2,400)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-15 PEN, OVERHEAD/BLK/PERM. 12/PKG.  (600)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-16 PEN, OVERHEAD/ASST./PERM 4/PKG.  (600)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-17 PENCIL SHARPENER METAL  EACH  (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-17 PENCIL SHARPENER METAL  EACH  (1,200) - ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-18 CLEANER, MARKERBOARD 8 oz. EACH  (3,000)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-21 RULERS, PLASTIC, 12"  Box   (1,800)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-22B SCISSORS 4-1/2" BLUNT 12/BOX  (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-22B SCISSORS 4-1/2" BLUNT 12/BOX  (1,200) - ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

P.O. Box 107
Kingsbury, IN 46345

800-847-9219

Bye-Mo'r, Inc.

Waynesboro, VA 22980
P.O. Box 178

888-885-2488

Classic School Supply, Inc. Con Serv Flag Company
P.O. Box 649

Sidney, NE 69162
308-254-4720

$6.52 $7,824.00 No Bid No Bid

$2.19 $5,256.00 No Bid No Bid

$6.58 $3,948.00 $5.08 $3,048.00 No Bid

$2.15 $1,290.00 $1.69 $1,014.00 No Bid

$6.28 $7,536.00 $5.63 $6,756.00 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$1.37 $4,110.00 $1.13 $3,390.00 No Bid

$1.709 $3,076.20 $0.99 $1,782.00 No Bid

$2.90 $3,480.00 $3.15 $3,780.00 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sanford Visa Vis 16001

Visa Vis 16074

Sanford Visa Vis 02101

Visa Vis 02174

Boston KS

Sanford Visa Vis 81803

Leonard 77412

Acme 10207

Perfection Stellar 04170

Perfection Stellar 04178

Status Plus 8801

Status Plus 06131

Status Plus 71

Status Plus 241B 4-1/2



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  MARCH 31, 2005 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
BID #06-008-GF

Item # Description
CS-22S SCISSORS 401/2" SHARP 12/BOX  (1,200)

Manufacturer and Model #

CS-22S SCISSORS 401/2" SHARP 12/BOX  (1,200) - ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-25 TAPE MASKING 3/4" 12/ PKG>  (240)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-25 TAPE MASKING 3/4" 12/ PKG>  (240) - ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-35 SHOWBOARDS, FOLDING 3'x4' EACH  (1,800)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-45 FASTENERS, RND/BRASS 3/8" 1,000/ CTN  (240)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-46 FASTENERS, RND/BRASS 1" 1,000/ CTN  (120)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-48 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 4/SET  (3,000)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-49 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 8/SET  (3,000)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-50 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 4/SET  (2,400)
Manufacturer and Model #

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

P.O. Box 107
Kingsbury, IN 46345

800-847-9219

Bye-Mo'r, Inc.

Waynesboro, VA 22980
P.O. Box 178

888-885-2488

Classic School Supply, Inc. Con Serv Flag Company
P.O. Box 649

Sidney, NE 69162
308-254-4720

$2.90 $3,480.00 $3.15 $3,780.00 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$6.94 $1,665.60 $8.39 $2,013.60 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$1.82 $3,276.00 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$2.30 $6,900.00 $1.72 $5,160.00 No Bid

$4.60 $13,800.00 $3.45 $10,350.00 No Bid

$2.308 $5,539.20 No Bid No Bid

Acme 10212

3-M 2600

*Pacon 3763

Expo 80074

Expo 80078

Expo 82074

Dixon 92180

Status Plus 241S 4-1/2

3-M 2600

Dixon 92140



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  MARCH 31, 2005 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
BID #06-008-GF

Item # Description
CS-51 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 8/SET  (2,400)

Manufacturer and Model #

CS-51 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 8/SET  (2,400)-ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-53 PENCILS, MECHANICAL  .5MM EACH  (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-55 PENCILS #2 (144/PKG.)  (2,400)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-56 PENCILS ELEC. TEST SCORING 12/BOX  (200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-57 ERASERS, MARKER BOARD MULTI PACK 12/BOX (
Manufacturer and Model #

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

P.O. Box 107
Kingsbury, IN 46345

800-847-9219

Bye-Mo'r, Inc.

Waynesboro, VA 22980
P.O. Box 178

888-885-2488

Classic School Supply, Inc. Con Serv Flag Company
P.O. Box 649

Sidney, NE 69162
308-254-4720

$5.35 $12,840.00 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$2.00 $2,400.00 No Bid No Bid

$4.35 $10,440.00 $4.21 $10,104.00 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$16.79 $5,037.00 No Bid No Bid

* 48 X 36

Expo 88078

Sanford 64051

Dixon 14412

Sanford 81505

14412



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  MARCH 31, 2005 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
BID #06-008-GF

Item # Description
CS-05 PINK PEARL ERASER  (2 dozen per box)  (600)

Manufacturer and Model #

CS-05 PINK PEARL ERASER  (2 dozen per box)  (600) - ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-07 FLAG, STATE  OUTDOOR (50)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-08 FLAG, US OUTDOOR  (100)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-08 FLAG, US OUTDOOR  (100) - ALTERNATE
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-09 GLUE 4 oz.  (12/box)   (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-09A GLUE  GALLON   (180)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-11   PASTE QUART     (120)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-12 PENCILS  ELEM.  W/ERASER  (12/box) (1,200)   
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-12 PENCILS  ELEM.  W/ERASER  (12/box) (1,200) - ALT  
Manufacturer and Model #

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
$1.63 $978.00 No Bid $1.80 $1,080.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$29.97 $1,498.50 $22.95 $1,147.50 $28.59 $1,429.50

$16.40 $1,640.00 $19.75 $1,975.00 $14.79 $1,479.00

No Bid $17.75 $1,775.00 No Bid

$3.71 $4,452.00 No Bid $3.72 $4,464.00

$5.39 $970.20 No Bid $5.15 $927.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$1.59 $1,908.00 No Bid $1.60 $1,920.00

No Bid No Bid $1.31 $1,572.00

260 Ryan Ave.
Chico, CA 95973

530-894-6338

Elgin School Supply Co.

Leonard 71504

******Valley Forge 35232095

Valley Forge 35111000

Elmers E304

Elmers E395

Dixon 13308

Heads Flags, Inc.
3815 Henderson Blvd.

Tampa, FL 33629
813-248-5019

Valley Forge 2090 (Nylon)

Flag Zone 1001051

Flag Zone 1202051 (Nylon)

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Street

Tampa, FL 33610
813-621-6446

Leonard 71504

Valley Forge 35232095

Valley Forge 35111000

Elmers School Glue E304

Elmers GlueAll E395

Dixon 13308

Musgrave 500T



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  MARCH 31, 2005 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
BID #06-008-GF

Item # Description
CS-13 PEN OVERHEAD  BLACK  REMOV. 12/PKG.   (1,200)

Manufacturer and Model #

CS-14 PEN, OVERHEAD ASSORTED 4/PKG.  (2,400)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-15 PEN, OVERHEAD/BLK/PERM. 12/PKG.  (600)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-16 PEN, OVERHEAD/ASST./PERM 4/PKG.  (600)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-17 PENCIL SHARPENER METAL  EACH  (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-17 PENCIL SHARPENER METAL  EACH  (1,200) - ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-18 CLEANER, MARKERBOARD 8 oz. EACH  (3,000)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-21 RULERS, PLASTIC, 12"  Box   (1,800)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-22B SCISSORS 4-1/2" BLUNT 12/BOX  (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-22B SCISSORS 4-1/2" BLUNT 12/BOX  (1,200) - ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

260 Ryan Ave.
Chico, CA 95973

530-894-6338

Elgin School Supply Co. Heads Flags, Inc.
3815 Henderson Blvd.

Tampa, FL 33629
813-248-5019

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Street

Tampa, FL 33610
813-621-6446

$6.16 $7,392.00 No Bid $1.93 $2,316.00

$2.07 $4,968.00 No Bid $0.88 $2,112.00

No Bid No Bid $2.00 $1,200.00

No Bid No Bid $1.04 $624.00

$5.79 $6,948.00 No Bid $5.80 $6,960.00

No Bid No Bid $5.39 $6,468.00

No Bid No Bid $1.05 $3,150.00

$1.41 $2,538.00 No Bid $0.96 $1,728.00

No Bid No Bid $2.59 $3,108.00

No Bid No Bid $2.10 $2,520.00

Vis A Vis 16001

Vis A Vis 16074

Boston KS1031

*Leonard 77412

Liqui Mark 12121

Liqui Mark 12004

Liqui Mark 17121

Liqui Mark 17400

*Falcon 7112

Acme 241B 4-1/2

SchoolMate 721

Boston KS1031

Leonard 89508

Azor PT5000



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  MARCH 31, 2005 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
BID #06-008-GF

Item # Description
CS-22S SCISSORS 401/2" SHARP 12/BOX  (1,200)

Manufacturer and Model #

CS-22S SCISSORS 401/2" SHARP 12/BOX  (1,200) - ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-25 TAPE MASKING 3/4" 12/ PKG>  (240)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-25 TAPE MASKING 3/4" 12/ PKG>  (240) - ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-35 SHOWBOARDS, FOLDING 3'x4' EACH  (1,800)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-45 FASTENERS, RND/BRASS 3/8" 1,000/ CTN  (240)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-46 FASTENERS, RND/BRASS 1" 1,000/ CTN  (120)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-48 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 4/SET  (3,000)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-49 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 8/SET  (3,000)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-50 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 4/SET  (2,400)
Manufacturer and Model #

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

260 Ryan Ave.
Chico, CA 95973

530-894-6338

Elgin School Supply Co. Heads Flags, Inc.
3815 Henderson Blvd.

Tampa, FL 33629
813-248-5019

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Street

Tampa, FL 33610
813-621-6446

No Bid No Bid $2.59 $3,108.00

No Bid No Bid $2.19 $2,628.00

$7.05 $1,692.00 No Bid $5.28 $1,267.20

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid $1.69 $3,042.00

$7.70 $1,848.00 No Bid $2.95 $708.00

$13.50 $1,620.00 No Bid $4.75 $570.00

$2.18 $6,540.00 No Bid $1.41 $4,230.00

$4.42 $13,260.00 No Bid $2.72 $8,160.00

$2.19 $5,256.00 No Bid $1.41 $3,384.00

***Expo 80078

Expo 82074

Armak PG500

Leonard 1R solid brass

Leonard 4R

**Expo 80074

Acme 241S 4-1/2

SchoolMate 722

**Shurtape  CP106

Showboard SB24

Leonard 1RBP

Leonard 4RBP

Liqui Mark 25400

Liqui Mark 25800

Liqui Mark 24400



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  MARCH 31, 2005 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
BID #06-008-GF

Item # Description
CS-51 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 8/SET  (2,400)

Manufacturer and Model #

CS-51 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 8/SET  (2,400)-ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-53 PENCILS, MECHANICAL  .5MM EACH  (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-55 PENCILS #2 (144/PKG.)  (2,400)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-56 PENCILS ELEC. TEST SCORING 12/BOX  (200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-57 ERASERS, MARKER BOARD MULTI PACK 12/BOX (
Manufacturer and Model #

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

260 Ryan Ave.
Chico, CA 95973

530-894-6338

Elgin School Supply Co. Heads Flags, Inc.
3815 Henderson Blvd.

Tampa, FL 33629
813-248-5019

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Street

Tampa, FL 33610
813-621-6446

$5.36 $12,864.00 No Bid $2.72 $6,528.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid $1.88 $2,256.00

$4.39 $10,536.00 No Bid $4.08 $9,792.00

$1.27 $254.00 No Bid $1.10 $220.00

$14.79 $4,437.00 No Bid $3.60 $1,080.00

*****Min order 70 packages

****Expo 88078

****Soon Discontinued, subj.

*1.41/12-Packed 3 dz/per box

to availability through Nov.

Dixon 14412

General 580

*****Sanford 81505

**Min order 480 sets
***Min order 288 sets

*.96/doz - Packed 36/box

SchoolMate 2060

Musgrave 100

**48 rolls/per case

Liqui Mark 24800

Sanford Logo II (64051)

Musgrave Propector II

******Polyester



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  MARCH 31, 2005 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
BID #06-008-GF

Item # Description
CS-05 PINK PEARL ERASER  (2 dozen per box)  (600)

Manufacturer and Model #

CS-05 PINK PEARL ERASER  (2 dozen per box)  (600) - ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-07 FLAG, STATE  OUTDOOR (50)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-08 FLAG, US OUTDOOR  (100)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-08 FLAG, US OUTDOOR  (100) - ALTERNATE
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-09 GLUE 4 oz.  (12/box)   (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-09A GLUE  GALLON   (180)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-11   PASTE QUART     (120)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-12 PENCILS  ELEM.  W/ERASER  (12/box) (1,200)   
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-12 PENCILS  ELEM.  W/ERASER  (12/box) (1,200) - ALT  
Manufacturer and Model #

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
No Bid No Bid $5.38 $3,228.00

No Bid No Bid $1.76 $1,056.00

No Bid No Bid $21.93 $1,096.50

No Bid No Bid $15.91 $1,591.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid $3.25 $3,900.00 $4.02 $4,824.00

$5.79 $1,042.20 $4.25 $765.00 $5.65 $1,017.00

No Bid No Bid $2.09 $250.80

No Bid No Bid $1.52 $1,824.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Quill Corporation
100 Schelter Rd.

Lincolnshire, IL 60069
800-634-4809

S & S Worldwide 
75 Mill Street

Colchester, CT 06415
800-243-9232

Colorsplash GL571

Colorsplash GL419XElmers BIDXE39NR

School Specialty, Inc.
100 Paragon Parkway
Mansfield, OH 44903

800-305-0174

Sanford 70520

School Smart 077355

Annin 140960 (nylon)

Annin 001160

Elmers E304NR

Elmers E395NR

Elmers E384NR

Dixon 13304



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  MARCH 31, 2005 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
BID #06-008-GF

Item # Description
CS-13 PEN OVERHEAD  BLACK  REMOV. 12/PKG.   (1,200)

Manufacturer and Model #

CS-14 PEN, OVERHEAD ASSORTED 4/PKG.  (2,400)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-15 PEN, OVERHEAD/BLK/PERM. 12/PKG.  (600)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-16 PEN, OVERHEAD/ASST./PERM 4/PKG.  (600)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-17 PENCIL SHARPENER METAL  EACH  (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-17 PENCIL SHARPENER METAL  EACH  (1,200) - ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-18 CLEANER, MARKERBOARD 8 oz. EACH  (3,000)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-21 RULERS, PLASTIC, 12"  Box   (1,800)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-22B SCISSORS 4-1/2" BLUNT 12/BOX  (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-22B SCISSORS 4-1/2" BLUNT 12/BOX  (1,200) - ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

Quill Corporation
100 Schelter Rd.

Lincolnshire, IL 60069
800-634-4809

S & S Worldwide 
75 Mill Street

Colchester, CT 06415
800-243-9232

School Specialty, Inc.
100 Paragon Parkway
Mansfield, OH 44903

800-305-0174

$7.27 $8,724.00 No Bid $5.11 $6,132.00

$2.13 $5,112.00 $1.18 $2,832.00 $1.67 $4,008.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid $1.18 $708.00 $2.33 $1,398.00

$8.71 $10,452.00 No Bid $7.07 $8,484.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$1.53 $4,590.00 No Bid $1.53 $4,590.00

No Bid No Bid $1.44 $2,592.00

No Bid No Bid $3.00 $3,600.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sanford BID16001

BID16074

Hunt BID1034Q

Sanford BID81823

Liqui Mark SC966

Liqui Mark SC966

Vis-Aid 88127

Vis-Aid 88240

Sanford Visa Vis 02174

Boston/Hunt KS1031

Expo 81803

*Acme 10526

**Acme 10207



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  MARCH 31, 2005 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
BID #06-008-GF

Item # Description
CS-22S SCISSORS 401/2" SHARP 12/BOX  (1,200)

Manufacturer and Model #

CS-22S SCISSORS 401/2" SHARP 12/BOX  (1,200) - ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-25 TAPE MASKING 3/4" 12/ PKG>  (240)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-25 TAPE MASKING 3/4" 12/ PKG>  (240) - ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-35 SHOWBOARDS, FOLDING 3'x4' EACH  (1,800)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-45 FASTENERS, RND/BRASS 3/8" 1,000/ CTN  (240)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-46 FASTENERS, RND/BRASS 1" 1,000/ CTN  (120)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-48 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 4/SET  (3,000)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-49 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 8/SET  (3,000)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-50 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 4/SET  (2,400)
Manufacturer and Model #

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

Quill Corporation
100 Schelter Rd.

Lincolnshire, IL 60069
800-634-4809

S & S Worldwide 
75 Mill Street

Colchester, CT 06415
800-243-9232

School Specialty, Inc.
100 Paragon Parkway
Mansfield, OH 44903

800-305-0174

No Bid No Bid $3.00 $3,600.00
**Acme 10212

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$8.48 $2,035.20 No Bid $7.68 $1,843.20

No Bid No Bid $6.24 $1,497.60

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid $4.00 $960.00

No Bid No Bid $6.40 $768.00

$3.06 $9,180.00 No Bid $1.37 $4,110.00

$6.04 $18,120.00 No Bid $2.67 $8,010.00

$3.06 $7,344.00 No Bid $1.37 $3,288.00

Quill BID765113

Expo BID83074

Expo BID83078

Expo BID88074

School Smart 55400

School Smart 55800

School Smart 54402

3-M 2600

Shurtape CP-83

School Smart 1R-BP

School Smart 59904



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  MARCH 31, 2005 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
BID #06-008-GF

Item # Description
CS-51 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 8/SET  (2,400)

Manufacturer and Model #

CS-51 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 8/SET  (2,400)-ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-53 PENCILS, MECHANICAL  .5MM EACH  (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-55 PENCILS #2 (144/PKG.)  (2,400)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-56 PENCILS ELEC. TEST SCORING 12/BOX  (200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-57 ERASERS, MARKER BOARD MULTI PACK 12/BOX (
Manufacturer and Model #

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

Quill Corporation
100 Schelter Rd.

Lincolnshire, IL 60069
800-634-4809

S & S Worldwide 
75 Mill Street

Colchester, CT 06415
800-243-9232

School Specialty, Inc.
100 Paragon Parkway
Mansfield, OH 44903

800-305-0174

No  Bid No Bid $2.67 $6,408.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid $7.20 $17,280.00 $5.29 $12,696.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid $4.68 $1,404.00

**Case 36

Sanford Eagle BD1861

School Smart 54802

School Smart 00009

School Smart 52060

*Packed 36 per box



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  MARCH 31, 2005 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
BID #06-008-GF

Item # Description
CS-05 PINK PEARL ERASER  (2 dozen per box)  (600)

Manufacturer and Model #

CS-05 PINK PEARL ERASER  (2 dozen per box)  (600) - ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-07 FLAG, STATE  OUTDOOR (50)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-08 FLAG, US OUTDOOR  (100)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-08 FLAG, US OUTDOOR  (100) - ALTERNATE
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-09 GLUE 4 oz.  (12/box)   (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-09A GLUE  GALLON   (180)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-11   PASTE QUART     (120)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-12 PENCILS  ELEM.  W/ERASER  (12/box) (1,200)   
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-12 PENCILS  ELEM.  W/ERASER  (12/box) (1,200) - ALT  
Manufacturer and Model #

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
$1.80 $1,080.00 $.958 $574.80 $5.50 $3,300.00

No Bid $1.28 $768.00 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid $14.11 $1,411.00 $16.87 $1,687.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$3.80 $4,560.00 $3.53 $4,236.00 $3.97 $4,764.00

$5.50 $990.00 $5.10 $918.00 $5.72 $1,029.60

$2.00 $240.00 No Bid $5.75 $690.00

$1.80 $2,160.00 $1.075 $1,290.00 $2.37 $2,844.00

No Bid $1.42 $1,704.00 No Bid

Windtree WP32

Dixon 13308

Windtree Enterprises, Inc.
P.O. Box 810700

Boca Raton, FL 33481
800-233-7042

Sanford 70520

Annin 001160

Elmers E304NR

Elmers E395NR

Musgraves 500

Dixon Beginner 13080

Standard Stationery Supply
2251 S. Foster Ave.
Wheeling, IL 60090

847-870-1335

Standards G9024

Standards G10024

Valley Forge 35111000

Elmers School Glue E304

Elmers E395

Musgrave 500-T

Leonard 71504

Elmers E304NR

Elmers E395NR

Elmers E384NR

Smith Office & Comp. Supply
1009 S. 21st Ave.

Hollywood, FL 33020
800-464-0874



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  MARCH 31, 2005 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
BID #06-008-GF

Item # Description
CS-13 PEN OVERHEAD  BLACK  REMOV. 12/PKG.   (1,200)

Manufacturer and Model #

CS-14 PEN, OVERHEAD ASSORTED 4/PKG.  (2,400)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-15 PEN, OVERHEAD/BLK/PERM. 12/PKG.  (600)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-16 PEN, OVERHEAD/ASST./PERM 4/PKG.  (600)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-17 PENCIL SHARPENER METAL  EACH  (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-17 PENCIL SHARPENER METAL  EACH  (1,200) - ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-18 CLEANER, MARKERBOARD 8 oz. EACH  (3,000)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-21 RULERS, PLASTIC, 12"  Box   (1,800)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-22B SCISSORS 4-1/2" BLUNT 12/BOX  (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-22B SCISSORS 4-1/2" BLUNT 12/BOX  (1,200) - ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

Windtree Enterprises, Inc.
P.O. Box 810700

Boca Raton, FL 33481
800-233-7042

Standard Stationery Supply
2251 S. Foster Ave.
Wheeling, IL 60090

847-870-1335

Smith Office & Comp. Supply
1009 S. 21st Ave.

Hollywood, FL 33020
800-464-0874

$1.95 $2,340.00 Disqualified $6.54 $7,848.00

$0.90 $2,160.00 Disqualified $2.19 $5,256.00

$1.95 $1,170.00 No Bid $6.75 $4,050.00

$1.07 $642.00 No Bid $2.29 $1,374.00

$5.75 $6,900.00 $5.72 $6,864.00 $6.55 $7,860.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$1.18 $3,540.00 $1.29 $3,870.00 $1.21 $3,630.00

No Bid $.918 $1,652.40 $3.35 $6,030.00

No Bid $2.46 $2,952.00 $5.54 $6,648.00

No Bid $2.37 $2,844.00 No Bid

Sanford SX-B17

Sanford SX-4PA

Boston KS

Undo 50000

Falcon PR-12

Armarda B245-45

Sanford 16001

Sanford 16074

*Standards 16220

Kleencut 241B 

Standard Stainless Steel 9416

Boston KS1031

Sanford Expo 81803

Liqui Mark 17400

Hunt KS1031

Correct Solution 50000

Liqui Mark 12121

Liqui Mark 12004

Liqui Mark 17121



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  MARCH 31, 2005 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
BID #06-008-GF

Item # Description
CS-22S SCISSORS 401/2" SHARP 12/BOX  (1,200)

Manufacturer and Model #

CS-22S SCISSORS 401/2" SHARP 12/BOX  (1,200) - ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-25 TAPE MASKING 3/4" 12/ PKG>  (240)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-25 TAPE MASKING 3/4" 12/ PKG>  (240) - ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-35 SHOWBOARDS, FOLDING 3'x4' EACH  (1,800)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-45 FASTENERS, RND/BRASS 3/8" 1,000/ CTN  (240)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-46 FASTENERS, RND/BRASS 1" 1,000/ CTN  (120)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-48 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 4/SET  (3,000)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-49 MARKERS DRY ERASE CHISEL 8/SET  (3,000)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-50 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 4/SET  (2,400)
Manufacturer and Model #

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

Windtree Enterprises, Inc.
P.O. Box 810700

Boca Raton, FL 33481
800-233-7042

Standard Stationery Supply
2251 S. Foster Ave.
Wheeling, IL 60090

847-870-1335

Smith Office & Comp. Supply
1009 S. 21st Ave.

Hollywood, FL 33020
800-464-0874

No Bid $2.46 $2,952.00 $5.54 $6,648.00

No Bid $2.37 $2,844.00 No Bid

$6.75 $1,620.00 $4.81 $1,154.40 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid $1.85 $3,330.00

No Bid $2.41 $578.40 No Bid

No Bid $3.41 $409.20 No Bid

$1.50 $4,500.00 Disqualified $2.76 $8,280.00

$2.90 $8,700.00 Disqualified $5.44 $16,320.00

$1.50 $3,600.00 Disqualified $2.76 $6,624.00

Sanford Expo 83078

Sanford Expo 88074

Armada S245-45

Flipside 30032

Sanford Expo 83074

Standard Stainless Steel 9430

Intertape PG500

General 1R

General 4R

Kleencut 241S

Liqui Mark 25400

Liqui Mark 25800

Liqui Mark 24400

3-M 2600 3/4



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING:  MARCH 31, 2005 2:30 PM
BID TITLE: CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
BID #06-008-GF

Item # Description
CS-51 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 8/SET  (2,400)

Manufacturer and Model #

CS-51 MARKERS DRY ERASE BULLET 8/SET  (2,400)-ALT
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-53 PENCILS, MECHANICAL  .5MM EACH  (1,200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-55 PENCILS #2 (144/PKG.)  (2,400)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-56 PENCILS ELEC. TEST SCORING 12/BOX  (200)
Manufacturer and Model #

CS-57 ERASERS, MARKER BOARD MULTI PACK 12/BOX (
Manufacturer and Model #

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

Windtree Enterprises, Inc.
P.O. Box 810700

Boca Raton, FL 33481
800-233-7042

Standard Stationery Supply
2251 S. Foster Ave.
Wheeling, IL 60090

847-870-1335

Smith Office & Comp. Supply
1009 S. 21st Ave.

Hollywood, FL 33020
800-464-0874

$2.90 $6,960.00 $2.75 $6,600.00 $5.44 $13,056.00

No Bid $5.09 $12,216.00 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid Disqualified $5.23 $12,552.00

No Bid $10.95 $2,190.00 $1.51 $302.00

$1.23 $369.00 $14.52 $4,356.00 $15.54 $4,662.00

Musgrave 100

Sanford 81505

Sanford Expo 88078

Sanford 22420

Elmers Min order $1200.00

Musgrave 100

Sanford 81505Sanford 81505

Liqui Mark 24800

*Packed 36/box

Liqui Mark 24800

Expo 88078


